

SEP 12 2016

RECEIVED

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

- Date Stamped Copy Returned
- No Self-Addressed Stamped Envelope
- No Copy Provided

In re

Chapter 11

Gawker Media LLC, *et al.*,¹

Case No. 16-11700 (SMB)

Debtors.

(Jointly Administered)



REQUEST FOR PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIM

1. Name of Claimant: JB DUNCAN, PC
2. Name of Debtor claim asserted against: GAWKER MEDIA, LLC
3. Nature and description of the claim (you may attach a separate summary):
4. Date(s) claim arose: JUNE 30, 2016 JULY 31, 2016, AUGUST 31, 2016
5. Amount of claim: \$ 5160.00
6. Documentation supporting the claim must be attached hereto. Documentation should include both evidence of the nature of the administrative expense claim asserted as well as evidence of the date or dates on which the administrative expense claim arose.

Date: SEPT. 9, 2016

Signature:

Name:

JOHN B DUNCAN

Address:

103 E. BLITHEDALE AVE, SUITE 7
MILL VALLEY CA 94941

Phone Number:

415-888-2369

¹ The last four digits of the taxpayer identification number of the debtors are: Gawker Media, LLC (0492); Gawker Media Group, Inc. (3231); and Kinja Kft. (5056). The offices of Gawker Media LLC and Gawker Media Group, Inc. are located at 114 Fifth Avenue, 2d Floor, New York, NY 10011. Kinja-Kft.'s offices are located at Andrassy ut 66. 1062 Budapest, Hungary.

John B. Duncan

JB Duncan, PC
 103 Blithedale Ave.
 Suite 7
 Mill Valley, CA 94941
 (415) 888-2369

Invoice Number 2016 - 6 - 1

June 30, 2016

Please Make Checks Payable to: JB Duncan PC (or wire the funds to the account below)

Gawker Media, LLC
 114 Fifth Avenue, Floor 2,
 New York, NY 10011

Bill.com Payment Network ID:
 0179784258790954

Wire Transfer Information:
 ABA 321171184
 Account Number 204351753
 JB Duncan PC
 Citibank, NA
 590 Market St.
 San Francisco, CA 94104

Expenses:

Invoice for Legal Services

From: June 10, 2016

To: June 30, 2016

Total Hours	3.7
Associate Time \$200/hour	\$ -
Total Current Charges	\$ 1,110.00
Outstanding	\$ -
Expenses	\$ -
Total Due	\$ 1,110.00

Date	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Charge
6/13/16	correspond re: officer appointments/titles, certificated shares, etc.	0.8	\$ 300.00	\$ 240.00
6/14/16	Correspond with Ropes re: Board etc.; call with David Sandyk	0.5	\$ 300.00	\$ 150.00
6/15/16	Update equity records to accelerate vesting for all	0.7	\$ 300.00	\$ 210.00
6/16/16	Correspond re: updated equity records	0.4	\$ 300.00	\$ 120.00
6/21/16	Correspond with Chris Mills Taxation re: recapitalization transaction	0.5	\$ 300.00	\$ 150.00
6/29/16	Review D&O records	0.4	\$ 300.00	\$ 120.00
6/30/16	Review D&O history	0.4	\$ 300.00	\$ 120.00

John B. Duncan

JB Duncan, PC
 103 Blithedale Ave.
 Suite 7
 Mill Valley, CA 94941
 (415) 888-2369

Invoice Number 2016 - 7 - 1

July 31, 2016

Please Make Checks Payable to: JB Duncan PC (or wire the funds to the account below)

Gawker Media, LLC
 114 Fifth Avenue, Floor 2,
 New York, NY 10011

Bill.com Payment Network ID:
 0179784258790954

Wire Transfer Information:
 ABA 321171184
 Account Number 204351753
 JB Duncan PC
 Citibank, NA
 590 Market St.
 San Francisco, CA 94104

Expenses:

Invoice for Legal Services

From: July 1, 2016
 To: July 31, 2016

Total Hours	2.5
Associate Time \$200/hour	\$ -
Total Current Charges	\$ 750.00
Outstanding	\$ 1,110.00
Expenses	\$ -
Total Due	\$ 1,860.00

Date	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Charge
7/1/16	Correspond re: board history, actions etc.	0.2	\$ 300.00	\$ 60.00
7/7/16	Review calculation of historic salary adjustments	0.3	\$ 300.00	\$ 90.00
7/8/16	Calculate cumulative salary adjustments	0.5	\$ 300.00	\$ 150.00
7/25/16	Correspond re: Kinja titles/ownership	0.2	\$ 300.00	\$ 60.00
7/26/16	Correspond with Kevin Draper	0.1	\$ 300.00	\$ 30.00
7/27/16	Call with Ropes and Gray; correspond with Bridget Brown re: TM/Kinja acquisition	0.4	\$ 300.00	\$ 120.00
7/29/16	Review bankruptcy filing re: fees	0.2	\$ 300.00	\$ 60.00
7/30/16	Review and update bankruptcy filing re: fees	0.6	\$ 300.00	\$ 180.00

John B. Duncan

JB Duncan, PC
 103 Blithedale Ave.
 Suite 7
 Mill Valley, CA 94941
 (415) 888-2369

Invoice Number 2016 - 8 - 1

August 31, 2016

Please Make Checks Payable to: JB Duncan PC (or wire the funds to the account below)

Gawker Media, LLC
 114 Fifth Avenue, Floor 2,
 New York, NY 10011

Bill.com Payment Network ID:
 0179784258790954

Wire Transfer Information:
 ABA 321171184
 Account Number 204351753
 JB Duncan PC
 Citibank, NA
 590 Market St.
 San Francisco, CA 94104

Expenses:

Invoice for Legal Services

From: August 1, 2016
 To: August 31, 2016

Total Hours	11.0
Associate Time \$200/hour	\$ -
Total Current Charges	\$ 3,300.00
Outstanding	\$ 1,860.00
Expenses	\$ -
Total Due	\$ 5,160.00

Date	Description of Services	Hours	Rate	Charge
8/1/16	Attn to Bankruptcy filing	0.3	\$ 300.00	\$ 90.00
8/2/16	Call with Ropes and Gray; attn to bankruptcy filing	0.3	\$ 300.00	\$ 90.00
8/3/16	Discuss history of corporate formation, etc.; Review Bankruptcy filing	0.9	\$ 300.00	\$ 270.00
8/4/16	Discuss history of IP transfers; confirm Kinja acquisition terms	0.7	\$ 300.00	\$ 210.00
8/5/16	Discuss TM issues with Ropes and Gray	0.5	\$ 300.00	\$ 150.00
8/7/16	Review AJ stock issuances; look for board materials	0.7	\$ 300.00	\$ 210.00
8/10/16	Review files to see if GM LLC assumed the liabilities of G Entertainment	0.6	\$ 300.00	\$ 180.00
8/11/16	follow up on G Entertainment issue	0.2	\$ 300.00	\$ 60.00
8/13/16	Attn to Bankruptcy filings	0.2	\$ 300.00	\$ 60.00
8/15/16	Correspond re: waterfall analysis	0.3	\$ 300.00	\$ 90.00
8/17/16	Attn to dividend story; review files for correspondence/actions; emails with HL re: waterfall	2.0	\$ 300.00	\$ 600.00
8/18/16	Call with HL re: waterfall; review worksheet being used, update for changes in capitalization; discuss Greenmount Creek transaction with Kavi	2.3	\$ 300.00	\$ 690.00
8/19/16	Call with Kavi, explain Greenmount Creek (GM, LTD) transaction	0.6	\$ 300.00	\$ 180.00
8/21/16	Summarize formation dates for each entity	0.4	\$ 300.00	\$ 120.00
8/24/16	Discuss Waterfall with HL	0.6	\$ 300.00	\$ 180.00
8/29/16	Correspond with Courtenay re: incumbency certificates	0.4	\$ 300.00	\$ 120.00

John B. Duncan
JB Duncan PC
103 E. Blithedale Avenue
Suite 7
Mill Valley, CA 94941

SAN FRANCISCO CA 941

09 SEP 2016 PM 5 L



RECEIVED
SEP 12 2016
PRIME CLERK LLC

GAWKER MEDIA, LLC CLAIMS PROCESSING CENTER
c/o PRIME CLERK
830 3RD AVENUE, 3RD FLOOR
NEW YORK, N.Y. 10022

10022-656975

